
UNTOLD MILLIONS

The end of this ‘Global Market’ is by the door, the end of backslidings, and all forms of 
disobedience is just by the door. If you go through the book of revelation, you will discover 
that everything the Master told us to watch out for at His second coming, have come to 
pass and the only one thing we are waiting for is the trumpet which could be at anytime. 
As I am working on this message the world leaders are having their ‘Global meeting in 
London. They came together to find out how they could have ‘Peace globally’ and world 
currency among many other things. I saw a placard with one of the protestors it reads 
‘ONE WORLD, ONE CURRENCY, ONE LEADER’. Rapture will soon take place. I have 
discovered that the church of God at large speak the ‘end time’ some even sing the end 
time but don’t live the end time.

A man had a dream in 1981, August, the Lord showed him the things that would ‘be’ just 
before rapture and after rapture. He was told not to share the dream with anyone until  
2009. To my surprise, most of the things the Lord showered him in 1981 are happening 
NOW. 

There are two major reasons that drove me to my knees to pray for myself, family and 
everyone and everything that has to do with my mission on earth.

Jeremiah 8:20

‘The harvest is past, the summer is ended, and we are not saved’
This will be the sorrow and lamentation of everyone who will not make heaven but for you 
and your family - you shall not see hell. The Savior Himself shall see to it that you are not 
left behind at rapture in Jesus name, Amen.

2 Thes 1:8&9’ in flaming fire taking vengeance on them that know not God and that 
obey not the gospel of our Lord Jesus Christ.

God is definitely going to take vengeance on those that waste His blood and grace, but 
there is still hope this minute. I am not sure of tomorrow, so, give your life to Christ today 
and remove your name from damnation.

The bible talks about surprise on that day. My dear, look around you and be sincere. Many 
surprises already in the house of God and especially among His ministers. The subtlety of  
Satan cannot be over emphasized. Many Christians have walked far away from destiny 
yet they profess to be serving God. Many are kept by the enemy in the dungeon of 
unforgiveness, yet they talk rapture; many have endangered their souls with envy and 
jealousy yet they said, they are going to make heaven; many are dead yet they all THINK 
that they are alive. Many have forgotten and they HATE to hear about rapture. My 
question is who is deceiving who? ‘Surely, God cannot be deceived'.



2 Tim 2:9 nevertheless the foundation of God standeth sure, having this seal. The 
Lord knoweth them that are His. And, let everyone that nameth the name of the Lord 
depart from iniquity.

Remember, all the people you invite to your church meetings, conventions and 
conference. Remember how good you are when it comes to Evangelism BUT God forbid 
that an unbeliever will ask you why you did not follow your ‘group’ at rapture, again I say 
‘GOD FORBID’. Ask yourself this sincere question If RAPTURE IS NOW, WHAT 
HAPPENS TO ME?

There is not love you can extend to anyone if you have not prayed the person into the 
gospel. I mean your spouse, children, friends, neighbors that are yet to know Christ,  
whatever you give or do to them does not show love because you know their end.

The conclusion of the whole matter is that you must remember that God would not have 
created you if your mission on earth was not needed, therefore YOU WILL GIVE A 
COMPREHENSIVE ACCOUNT OF YOUR JOURNEY IN THIS ‘GLOBAL MARKET ONE 
DAY.

I sincerely pray that whosoever that the enemy has done in and around you to qualify you 
in hell be destroyed in Jesus name.

This message is taken from ‘Untold Millions’. An audio message both in English and 
Yoruba languages; for the purpose of preparing us all for rapture and Evangelism.


